()

(Act'"zx of 1887)

CONTEHTS

Section

CHAPTER I

Preliminary

'1;5Title, exﬁent and Congl=

encement.

 Repeal of Acts 6 of 1871
“:and 19 of 1887,

CHAPTER II

Censtitution of Civil
Courts

Classes of Courts.

Number of Pistrict
Judges, Subordinate
Judges and Munsifs.

éfRePealedéz,

Vacancies among District
or Subordinate Judges.

, / Repealed /.
Additional Judges.

'Aﬁministrat;ve Control
d 3: Ceurtao -

LTemporary charge of
-_:Bistr;t.ct Courtses

Traansfer of praceedlngs
on vacation of office of
subordinate Judges.

- [Repealedja

13. Power to £ix local

Amits of Jurisdic—
LO of Gourts.

CHAPTER

ordinary

Extent. of
Munsif. -

Addltional

Appeals from Subo
Judges and Muns

CHAPTER IV
‘special Jurisd

Power to tranéfa.
dinate Judges app
Munsifis.

Exercised by
Judge or Huns
dictxon of 9153*

Disposal of
referred to i
ing sectien.

“Judges and

11 Causes Cenr




. {
5 ’
{gﬁ 37. Certain decisions to be 39, Subordination of Courts to
» according to native law. District Court. '
38, Judges nob to by sult in 0. Application of Act to Pro-
which they are interested. vincial Courts of Small
Cause

Sa

/1lth March,1887_7

An Act to consolidate and amend the law relating to
the Civil Courts in Bangal, the North-Western Provinces
and Assan.

A Whereas it is expedient to consolidate and amend the Law |

relading to Civil Courts in Bengal, the Horth=i¥estarn Provinces
and Assam ¢ X
i

It is hereby enacted as follows 3

CHAPTER I

3 Prelimipary.

1. Title, extent and commencement.- {1) This Act may be |}
called the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil Courts aAckt, 1887. -4

\ (2) Tt extends to the territories (which were on the 1ith
'y Marah 1887) respectively administered by the Lieutenant- )
i Governor of the North=Western Provinces and the Chief Commissio%;
ner of Assam except such protions of those territories as for |
the time being are not subject €O the ordinary civil jurisdice- E

i +ion of the High Court. 5
| i/

(3) It shall come into forcs on the first day of July,1887.

R S

o : 2. Repeal of Acts =& & of 1871 and 19 of 1887. = (1) /Repe-
aled by the Amending aAct, 1891 (12 of 1891)_/.

S

r (2) All courts constituted, anpolntments, nominati einn
and orders made, jurisdictions and powers conferred, 2
1ists published under the Bengal Civil Courts Act, 1871,
epnactment thereby repealed, oOF pDurperting expressly or ir
to have besn 80 cmnaitituted, made, conferred and publiéheis
3On§,r be deamed to have been mspectively constituted, made, COlim

g 2fUic,.  and published under this Act; and %
x5

o PR - . .
pl??Y_,\f {3) Any eraciment oy document referring to the Benga
?ﬁ ;edly | Courts Act, 1871, or to amy enactment thereby repealad,
) Ral* .’ pe construed to refer to this Ackt or to the corresponding

fe}"‘ r\-ﬂ I 7

\j~a7 portion thereof.

o NOTES

This Act has been extended to Assam DY Assam Act VI g2l




InTtem (3

Kxnown as Civi

court of the Munsif,
Judge, is one court Lho
ict Judge or

Agsistant Dis
Court and in

Munsifs but every ¢

1iAted part of the di

Civil Courts
authorised to

order 22 Z*Gyant Devi V.

4. Number

: 3. Classes of
- oF Civil Courts under

(1) the Court of
(2) the Court of
(3) the Court of
(4) the Court of

been gubstituted DY
Assam Act XIL of 1967.

CHAPTER 11

} of the section-the words "Subordinate Judge™ have
the words spssistant Pist

T

Courts. There shall

Constitution of Civil Courts

this Act, namely 3

NOTE

Wnen other Acts refer to
some other Civil Courtss

some cases to t
ministrative purposes
rion of the Munsif in

to s8¥Y
the id

iinsif is

stricte

and as such the

derermine the

the District Judge #
the Additional Judge
the A

S

€

Civil Courts, th

they refer @ +he Courts which are

1 Courts under this Act. Under rhis secilon, the
Additional Judge or Assi
ugh there may be more
as suche. It is open for the High

& Tocal Governments for mere ad=-

t+hat for exercis

atrict there may be one Or MOrse
a Munsif for the district although
by an administrative order he exercises jurisdiction over a
Section 3 lays down classes of

Registrar of 2 H
guestion covered

Lakshmi DSV, ATR 17

of District Judges. subordinate =
£ may alter vhe number of Dis crict o

Munsifs. The State Governmen

Judges, Subozrdl

pnate Judges &

£, Number of Munsifs. a
act, 1914 (4 of 1914)_/-

6. Vacancies 2000J

Whenever the

vacant by reason of the d

Judge oxr othe
of District ©
provisions sf

may be, the High Court may
\ additional Di

o
Ot Of

ssistant District Judge: and
the Munsife '

1

be the following classes

¥

rict Judge" WY

ey do not refer to

stant District
than one vunsit,

ing the jurisdic=
igh Court is not

by Rule 5 of
75 Pat.138.

Judges and

nd Munsifs nov £ixed.

Repealed DY the Decentralization

District or subordinate Judges. (1}

District Judge oL Subordinate Judge is

sath, regighation o

r cause, Or whenever an increass
udges has boeed maddunder the

r subordinate J

section

strict Judg

removal of the
in the number

4, the State Govarnment, °X 85 the case
11l up the vacancy or appolint the

F=4
N

or Subordinate Judgee

R i e




(2) Nething in this section shall be construed to prevent
a State Government from appointing a District Judge or Subor-
dinate Judge to discharge for such period as ix thinks f£it, in
#addition to the functions develving on nim as such District
Judge, of Subordinate Judge, all or any of the functions of :
another District Judge, O Subeordinate Judge, a8 the case may (s
be. -
| ;

NOTES

Tn Assam, there is 0o separate class of Court of Additional
Diatrict Judge. The Additional District Judge appointed in that
area under Section © (1) of this Act mX rust, therefore, be
deemed to be a division Court of the District Judge and not a
separate and discrict Court of 1ts Owis / Bagar Choudhury Ve
Nalein Choudhury, AIR 1970 Assam and Nagaland 111 /- The power
of transfer of all District Judges is vested in High Court By
virtue of Article 235 of the Constitution.

T Tt

= vacancies among Mansifs.== / Repealed by the Adaptation

F

of Laws Oraer, 1937 /s

=
oy

8. additional Judges.=={(1) When the misiness pending before
any District Judge requires tne aid Yof Additional Judges for
its speedy disposal, the Stahe CGovernment may, having consulted
witn the High Court, appoint such Additional Judges as may be

3 requisites .
E (2) additional Judges SO appointed shall discharge any of 3
rhe District Judge may - ?

A

] the functions, of 2 District Judge wihich
assign to them, and, in the discharge of those functions they
shall exercise the same powers as the District Judge.

NOTES j

3

*% The power to rransfer glass of 2 particular case under th= ;
i is section is not barreds [/ Bijan Kumar Bose V. Gouri Bose, AIR |
1975 Pat 13147. There is no Additlonal Judgs in Assame i

o e T

i 9. Administrative control of Court.=-Subject to the Super=
intendence of the High Court the Pistrict Judge shallhave admi-
nistrative control over all the Civil Courts under this Act '
within the local 1imits of his jurisdiction.
NOTES
ror administrative control over subordinate Courtse refer= :
ence may be made Lo Civii Rulces and Orders {Volume 1), Chapter
33, This section places a1l Civil Courts in & district undexr
administrative control of District Judde., within the local
1imits of his jurisdiction.

e




(2) while in charge of the ffice of the Pistrict Judg
2dditional Judge or Subordinate dudge as the case may i
Lrsgbjeetﬂto'any=rules-whidh~ﬁhé High Court may make in thi
alf, exercise any of the powers of the District Judge
~ The senior Bubordinate Judge, without relinguishln
dinarY'dutieS,EQaQQSQ;BSSHNE'@empérafy charge of the
_H}§HEiﬁistrict“Jﬁd@é;subjecﬁ.hﬁwever, to any rules whig
fgh Court may make to exercise a ' '
_trict Judge. e b
exclusive powe

o 1l. Transfer of proceedings on vacatlon of office o
Subordinate Judges.==(1) In the event of the death, re ign
or removal of a Subordinate Judge, or of his being inc
by illness or otherwise @k for the performance of his dutde
of his absence from the pdace at waich 4 his Court is held
District Judge may, transfer all or any of the proceedin
~ding in the court of the Subordinate Judge, either to hi
- Court or to any Court under his administrative control
~to dispose of them. _ D
(2) Proceedings transferred under sub-section (1) =h
disposed of as if they have been instituted in the Cou
_which they are so transferred. et

- (3) Provided that the Pistxict Judge msy re=transfer o

. Court of the Subordinate Judge or hls successors any pr
transferred under sub-section (1} to his own Court or 2k

. (4) For the purposes of proceedings which are not
in the court of the Subordinate Judge on the OCCUITencE

avent referred to in sub-sectlon (1), and with respect &g

. that Court has exclusive jurisdiction, the District;q'a

_exercise all or any of the jurisdiction of that Cour

NOTES

absence of Assistant Pistrict Judge, the P
otent to hepe an appeal from the oxder oI a
angilal Agarwslila V. Jamunalal_égarwal

galand 122 7.




-5 -
g
12. Temporary charge of offiicz of Muﬂsiﬁfs.uuéfRepealed i
by the Adaptation of Laws O rder, 393?_f. é
13. Power to fix local limits of jurisdiction of Courtg,gné
{1) The State Government may, by notlr i i
Gazette, fix and altexr the local limits of
any Civil Cour:t undef this Act.

3 LS
LAY

(2) Tf the same local jurisdiction is assigned to tWo O
more Subordinate Judges or IWo 0 OIS Munsiffs, the District
Qudge may assign to each of them such civil business cognizable
by the Subordinate Judge or Munsiff as the case may be, &S Sube=
ject to ey general or special orders of the High Court, % he
£it ' '

E T
SIS LT e

3

rea 18 asdie

(3} When civil business arising in any local ar S
Jned by the District Judge under sub-gection (2), Lo one or LWo
or more Suberdinate Judges or To onhe Or wwo or more Munsiffs, a
decree or order passed by the Sybordinate Judge or Munsif shall
not be invalie by resson only of the case in which 1t was made
having arisen wholly or in part in a place beyond the local
area if that mm place is within the local limits fixed by the
State Covernment by Subesection (1).

(4) The Judge of a Court of Swall Causes appointed to be

' wnsiff, as the case may pe, within

(5) The present local limits of the jurisdicgtion of
every Civil Court under this Act shalil be deened to have been
fixed under this sections

not affect a transiar ;
ibutes, as a matter of

re certain local

3}
ol
8]
I

An order under Secticn 13 (
of jurisdiction, because it merely &
administrative convenience and Wi ] e
areas, the civil husiness amEngesc v ora Courts each of
which has jurisdictiocn over the whole area. But where 4 the
State Covernment nhas conferred ob him a particular surisdiction
that cannot be divested by District Judge.

3

VI )]

e
1

Fal
Wi
iy

Tt
)

N o T ol
)]

i
IS
[

i’

The District Judge canno® take away the jurisdiction of 2!

Court to execute a decres passed by it, when 1t is the only
Court which can execute it under the provisions of Section 38

read with Section 37 of the ~ivil srocedure Code. Where the
trial Judge who tried the case at Gauhati, had jugisdiction to
try the case at Tezpur and vice versa, the fact that he did not
try the case at Tezpur but at Gauhati would not make the order
or judgement invali@ for that redscns / BIR 1952 Assam 88 /-

The Supremg Court held in Triogi Nath v. Indian Iron and
steel Co. Ltd. / AIR 1963 SC 205_Jthat the labour Courts con=
stituted under the Industrial Disputes Act have no comparison
with the courts constituted under this Act. '




4

‘ﬂ?ﬂ

The Allahabad High Court held in Nand Kishore v. Mool
Chandra é AIR 1966 All 61342 that Section 31 of the Arbitra“' q :
Act does net prevent a LDistrict Judge from exercising his pow .
of transfer under Section 13, or under the provisions of u*P

R

) The State Government
e, fix or alter the :
2r this Act is to ke held

14. Place of sitting of Courtg.=- {
may by notification in the Officlal Gazet
place or places which any Civil Court unde

(2) All nlacas at which any such courts are now hdld,shall
be deemed to have been fixed under this section.

It is not the actual sitting on,a particular day that
determines the situation of the Court but the situation is de-
termined by the placed of sitting as reguired by the Law for
that purpose.

= T

prepare a
in the ClVli Courts

(2) The lis+ shall he published in the officlal Gazette.
E

~ (3) A judicial act done by a Civil Court on a day speci-
fied in the list shall not be invalid by reason only oI Lts

Under ¢ enments Act, when a day is deolzx
red to be a hollday, the hzcn Court may also by a notification
declare a holiday for the Civil Courts subordinate to it under

this Saction.
gl

55
‘c:
0
e
o b
P
o
l._J
ﬂJ
..._i
]
0
r
iy

16. Seals of Court.--Everv Civil Court under this Act i
shall use a seal of such form and dimensicons as are nrescribed
by the State Government.

1;3C91t1nuan ceasing to have

jurisdiction.=--{1} ¥her e t’is Act has #

for any cause ceased toe have jurisdiction with respect to any

case, any proceading i iatzinn to that case whlch, if that

Court have not ceased to have jurisdiction, might have been,

had the cass theral ay be had in the court to vhich the busi=
o has been transferred.

ness 0f

(2) Nothing in this saction applies to cases from which
provision is made in Sections 35,37 and 114 of, and Rule 1 of

AT




-8=l

order XLVII in Schedule I to the Code of Civil Procedurs, 1908,
or in any other enactment for the time being ia force.

NOTES

Under the clrcumstances when the court which passed the
decree is abolished, it is the court to which ita pusiness Bt
is transferred is competent to execute the decree.

CHAPTER III
ORDINARY JURISDICTION

18. Extent of original jurisdiction of Digtrict or
Subordinate Judge.=--Save as otherwise provided by any enactment
for the time being in force, the jurisdictlion of a District
Judge or Subordinate Judge extends, subject to the provisions
of Section 15 of the Code of Civil procadure, 1908 O all
original suits for the time belng cognizable by Civil Courts.

NOTES

The figure "1208" has been inserted by Assanm Act VI of
1935

S et s T 2 B

19. Extent of jurisdiction of Munsif.=-(1) Save as aforaal
and subject to the provision of sub-section (2), the jurisdictlo
of a Mu %gygxtends to all like suits of whidh the value does W
exceed ngee-thousand rupees.

(2) The State Government may, o the recommendation of the
High Court, direct, by notificationinithe official Gazette with
respect to any Munsif named rharein that his juris@ép n shall
axtend to all like sults of such value not exceeding five thou=
sand rupees as may pe specified in the notilfication 2 -

Provided that the State Goyvernment may, PY aotification in
the official Gazette. delagate to the High Court its powers unde
this Sectlon. .

NOTES

The sub=clause (b) in sub-section (2) has been deleted by
Assam Act IX of 1965 and by the same Assam Amendment ACt, Sub=-
clause (a) has beebn merged in subegection (2) and for the words
"one thousand” occuring in sub=section (1) the woprds "three
thousand” has been substituted and in sub=section (2) for the
words "two rhousand”, the words "five +housand® have been
substituted. ;

S T s T




[ -gﬂ

20. Appeals from District and Additional Judges.=={(1)Save
as otherwise provided by any enactment for the time being in
force, an appeal from a decree or order of a District Judge or
an Additional Judge shall lie to the High Court.

(2) An appeal shall not lie to the High Court from a
decree or order of an Additicnal Judge in any case in which if
the decree or order has been made by the District Judge, an
appeal would mot lie to that Court.

NOTES

This secticn does not glve right of appeal from every or=
der of a District Judge to the High Court. It only deals with
the form of appeal.

In Assam there is no Additional Judge at present.

21. Appeals from Subordinate Judges and Munsifs.==(1)Save
as aforesald, an appeal from a decree or order of a Subordinate
Judge shall lig==

(a) to the District Judge where the value of the
original suit in vhich or im any proceeding arising out of
which the decree or order was made did not exceed seven
thousand rupees. : %=E¢&%

(b) to the High Court in any other casee.

(2) Save as aforesaid, an appeal from a decree Or an orde
of a Munsif shall lie to the Pistrict Judge.

(3) Where the function of receiving any appeals which 1¥
to the District Judge under sube-sectiion (1) or sub=section {2
has been assigned to an Additional Judge, the appeals may be pi
ferred to theAdditional Judge.

(4) The High Court may, with the previous sanction of the
State Covernment direct, by notification in the official Gazety
that appeals lying in the District Judge under Sub-section (2) .
from all or any of the decrees or orders of any Munsif shall be
preferced to the Court of such Subordinate Judge as may be men=
tioned in the notification , and the appeals shall thereupon be
preferred accordingly.

NOTES

Tn clause (a) of sub-section (1), for the words "five
thousand rupees”, the words "seven thousand rupees" have been
substituted by Assam Act IX of 1965, and these provisions shal
apply irrespective of the fact that suits, proceedings,decrees
or orders out of which the =ppeals referred to therein arise w¢
instituted or made prior to the commencement of Assam Amendmeni

Under Secktion 5 (2) of the said Assam Amendment Act, nol
withstanding anything to the contrary contained in the Limita’
Act, 1963, an appeal from a decree or order made before the
commencement of this Amendment Act, which but for the provisi
of such Act, gould have been preferred before the High Court




within ninety days from the date of such decree or order, shall
be preferred before the District Judge, within the said period.
Nothing in this Amendment Act shall be deemed to affect any
appeal instituted wior to the commendement of such Act.

It is true that an appeal from an original order or decree
of the Court of Munsif shall lie to the Assistant Pistrict Judge
even then on the occurance of an event under Section 11{4) of
the Ack, 3 District Judge may exercise all or any jurisdiction
of the Court of Assistant District Judge. /Mabgilal, Agarwalla
v. Jamunalal Ararwalla, AIR 1971 Assam and Nagaland 122“7.

- = TS

CHAPTER IV
SPECIAL JURISDICTION

22. Power to transfer to Subordinate Judges, appeals from
Munsifs.—={(1) A District Judge may transfer to any Subordinate
Judge under his administrative control any appeals pending mmmxgfx
before him from the decrass or orders of Munsiffis.

(2) The Pistrict Judge may withdraw any appeal §o trans-
ferred and either Yhear and dispose of 1t himself or transfer it
to a Court under Z his administrative control competent to
dispose of it.

(3) Appeals transferred under this section shall be dispo
sed of subject to the rule applicaple to like appeals when
disposed of by the District Judge. :

NOTES

A District Judge, to whom an appeal is preferred under
Section 21 against an order of the Munsif, has power to transf
 the appeal to a Subordinate Judge and the latter has the Juris-
diction to dispose of the appeal.

e e

23. Exercise by Subordinate Judge or Munsif of jurisdicti
of District Court ia certain proceedings.==(1) The High Court
may, by general or special order, authorize and§ Subordinate Judl
or Munsif to take cognizance of, or any Distrift Judge to trans
feor to a Subordinate Judge or MinslE under his administrative
control, any of the proceedings next hereinafter mentioned or &
class of those proceedings specified inthe order.

{2) The proceedings referrsd to in sub-section (1) are ti
following namely @

(a) Proceedings under Bengal Regulation 5, 1799 {ta
1imit the interference of the Zilla and City Courts of
Diwani Adalat in the execution of wlills and administratl
to the estates of persons dylmg intestate). :

[(b) ok kkkokdokk ok k _7.
[{c) kkxkHEE KA KRE _7__

S B




= 11 =

{d) Proceedings under the Indian Succession Act,
1925 which cannot be disposed of by District Delegates;
and

(e) References by Collectors under paragraph 5 of
the Third Schedule to the Code of Civil Procedure; 1908.

(3) The District Judge may withdraw any such proceedings
taken cognizance of by, or transferred to, a Subordinate Judge
or Munsif, and may either himself dispose of them or transfer
them to a Courg under his administrative control competent to
dispose of them. - -

NOTES .
This section has been amended by Assam Act VI of 1935.

24. Disposal of proceedings referred to in last fore=
golng sectlon.--(1) Proceedings taken cognizance of by, or
transferred to, a Subordinate Judge of Munsif, as the case may
be, under the last foregoing section shall be dispoged of by
him subject to the rules applicable to like proceedings when
disposed of by the District Judge:

Provided that an appeal from an order of a Munsif in
any such proceedings shall lie to the District Judge.

(2) An appeal from the order of the District Judge on
the appeal from the order of a Munsif under this section shall
lie to the High Court if a further appeal from the order of th
District Judge is allowed by the law for the time being in
force.

25. Power to invest Subordinate Judges and Munsifs with
Small Causes Court jurisdiction.=-The State Government may, by
notification in the official Gazette, confer, with such local
limits as it thinks fil upon any Subordinate Judge or Munsif
the jurisdiction of a Judge of a Court of Small Causes under
the Provincial small Cause Courts Act, 1887 for the trial of
suits cognizable by such Courts up to such value not exceeding
seven hundred and fifty rupees in the case of a Subordinate
Judge or three hundred rupees in the case of a Munsif as it
thinks £it, and may withdraw any jurisdiction so conferred:

Provided that the State Government may, by notification
in the official Gazette delegate to the High Court its powers
under this section.

NOTES
Section 25 is amended by Assam Act VI of 1935.

/ Chapters V and VI containing Sections 26 to 29 and
30 to 35 have been repealed .




- - rving in any other g&rﬁj
.which this Aet extenéa and beloagiﬂg”

cers invested with the powe 3
~with the powers of a Distri

tﬁe pawers under subvsnction {1f
fiXEd nnder Section 14, the uou;

_viage or oaste, or any religﬁgus usage
ammadan Law 19 cases where the parties'

,:;fcrm the rule of decision exce?t in so far as G
L_Iegislative enactment, been altered or abolish _’

any other law for the time being in force, theg _
according to justice, equity and good conscience

NOTES

Under thés sectlon neither Hzndus aox Mo
nst their will should be subjected to the la
-.allaws & person to adopt for himself any 38p




il .".4-,,,._.”*—

:Thefﬁ:esidiag{eﬁiyce;gg"“
Gr'gther_proeeédiagftb whic
personnally interegtea.¢};q

::fﬁhQEr'this~Act,]shall.neﬁ’try3ah:app¢alﬁag

~ rred to in sub-section (1) of eub-sectioa (2), comes
_any such officer, the officex shall forthwith gran

_ éxtraorainary original civil jurisdiction ~f the High Court.

P eourt subject to the admimlstrative centrol of the District

el kst e Shc

- ¢civil Precedure, 1905 the Court of such 30 officer shall be _

38, Judges not to

'(2)ZThe‘ﬁrﬁSiding;affiéaniefﬁég'
order passed by himself iﬁ_aﬂatﬁerfeapaéiﬁy.;“,;
' (3) When any such suit, sroceeding or appea.

record of the case to the Court to which he is imme

subordinate with a report of the circumstances atten
reference. e ' g >
(4) The Superior Court shall thersupon Z diépdseigﬁgt
case under Section 24 of the Code of Civil Procedure,iS08.

(5) Nothing in this section shall be desmed o affect th

| NOTES |
This section has been amended by Assam aAct V:_ofsléés;”f;

39. Subo:dinétion of Courts o District Caartsééﬁﬁﬁt*
purpose of the last foregoing section, the presiding-effi

Judge shall be deemed to b€ immediately subordinate to the
Court of the District Judge, aad for the purpose of the Code

deemed to be of a grade inferior to that of the Court pf the
District Judges - e ey
' - § o

40. Applicationm of ACT o Provimcial Courts of Small

. CauseS.=-(1) This section, and Sections 15,31,37,38 and 39
apply to i |

| the Court of Small Causes constituted under the

pProvincial Causes Courts act, 1887. L
(2) Save as provided by this Act, the other sectlions

this Act do not apply ®o those Courts. - T




-
*

ASSAM ACT VI OF 193s.

[Published in the dssam Gag
THE BENGAL, AGRA

ette of 4th Decombar 1035 N |

AND
DMENT) ACT,-

o

AN

COURTS (ASSAM AMEN
1985, i i

: . ACT
ko amend the Bengal, Agra png Assam O pil

Courts det, 1587, su $¢s
Waxzgas

. in its application to Assam
after 4ppearing ;

it is expedient to
Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil Courts

application fo Assan,.
the
Act, 1887,

2 ; XX of 188y,
in the manuer herejn.

It is horeby enacted ag follows ;—

Bhork Litie
sxtent wo

L. (1) This Act may he

called ghe Beugal, Agra

sotimencument. and & yuam Civil Courts {Assam Amendment) Aot

1835,

Application of
s

Amsndment of
seotion 17,

8. In sub-section (2) of seetion

, 2. The Bengg], Agra and Assam Civil Courtg

. Act, 1887, hereinaftor refarred to as the said Aot
- shall, in its application, to Assam, be
- khe mannep- hereinaftay DOV~ —menseiennicnr

Amended . iz S

17 of the said

40k, for the words ang figures ““in geotion 623 or

section 649 of the Cods of

Civil Proceduge » the

words and figureg ¢ iy sections 38, 87 ang 114 of,

and rule 1 of Ordey XLVII
' nga of Civil Prscedure, 1908 » shall be substitug.
- ed. .' :

ettt o B In sections 18 80d 89 of the saig Let, after the
- worde “ Code of Qiyj] Procedure # g1, figures
1908 ’ ghall be inserted,
imendment of 5. In subessction (2) of section 19 of the gaig -
section 17, Act, for the words beginning with « that his juris. ~ -
totion ” and ending with “in the nofificatiop »
the following ghal] be substituted, namely 31—
“(a) that his Jurisdiotion ghy] extand o g
like ruite of syeh value nog exceeding
two thel}sand Ilupees - gg may be
specified in the nobifieation, o
Prioe Id, Linglish.) [Indign nnd ]
i i "‘*‘“‘“me _“"“.“-"‘

in Schedyle T to, the

ASSAM CIVIL™ d o

-%--w_.:ﬂ."‘ >

LA SRR P
o Pt T

TR TNPE |
: et

L SR

A



4







.
/ v
) .
i
I !
Pl
J .m .
wu " . . .
S
| . ‘ = 44. 4.___ . K
e ' {

e







-\.""_(Reeeviéd the assent of th' ._Ptesulcnt on the 24th April 1974)-'- -

HE BENGAL, _GRA AND",ASSAM CIVIL COURTS (&SSAM o
s AGT 1973 _ o

o the S‘tﬁte of Assam R
expédlent to amend the Bengal Central Act

' il Courts Act, 1887, herein- I?:'°f;_1537f
called the prin pal Act, in its apphcatlon to o
tate' of Assam .m the manner heremafter'

I i
(2) Notmthstandmg anythzng to the contrary C‘enﬁra A
: contamed 111 the Lxmltatlon A@t 1963 an 6 Qf 1963
. 'e{y days Ir t
i _— uch decree or order, shall be pref
: the Dlstn_ Judge wﬁhm the - said




(er

+

TagE AW, 6-12 Registered No. A-12

The Assam Gazette

(LRINIER
| =X TRAQRDINARY

mﬂ~§mﬁ1éﬂ1amhm '

.PUBLISHED EY AUTHORITY

72 fipoe, woild, O %, 1979, 18 =ted, 190C (%%)
No.79 Dispar, Friday, 9th March, 1979, 18th Phalguna,
- 1900 (S, E.) ' ' -

e

GOVERNMENT OF ASSAM

S _ ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR

LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT

e s .

NOTIFICATION T

The 8th/9th March 1979

No.LGL.431/78/15.—The following “Act of the Assam
Legislative Assembly which received the assent of the
President is hereby published for general information.




R

S

588 THE ASSAM GAZETTE, %I‘RAORDINARY. MAR. 9, 1979

ASSAM ACT 1 OF 1979

&
(Received the assent of the President on
i7th February, 1879)
THE BENGAL, AGRA AND ASSAM CIVIL COURTS
(ASSAM AMENDMENT) ACT, 1978.
Vo ' An
Act
further to amend the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil
Courts Act, 1887, in its application to the State of Assam.
Pream Fle. Whereas it is expedient 10 amend f_fﬂ;}'ffg‘;f'
the BRengal, Agra and Assam Civil Courts
Act, 1887, hereinafter called the princi-
pal Act, in its application to the State
of Assam, in the marnner hereinafter
appearing ;
s It is hereby enacted in the Twenty-
‘ ninth Year of the Republic of India as
follows :— o
Shon e 1. (1) This Act may be called the
e ence- BeENgal, Agra ond Assam Civil Courts
\ ment, . {Agsam Amendment) Act, 1978.
(2) Tt shall extend to the whole
State of Assam.
(3) 1t shall come into force at once.
Ai\;n;élcl;zncnt 9. In Section 19. of the principal
of Seviot  Act, in sub-section (2), for the. words
i ?;ﬂ‘;“’-l‘sf;“t “fve thousand rupees’ the words  “ten
’, of 1887 41, eand rupees”’ shall be substituted.
! Amendtent 5 Tn Section 21 of the principal Act,
i 21 of the 1N sub-section (1), in clause (a), for the
i Gentral &t words “giteen - thousand —rupees’ the
t words “twenty thousand rupees’  shall
{ - be substituted. - -
‘t . .
{
b




THE ASSAM GAZETTE, EXTRA®RDINARY, MAR. 9, 1979 589

Retrospec-
tIve opera-
tinn,

Savingse,

4. (1) The provision of clause (a) of 0132,
sub-section (1) of Section 21 ef the 1887
principal Act as amended by Section 3
of this Act shall apply irrespective of
the fact that suits, proceedings, decrees
or orders out of which the appeals re-
ferred to therein arise were ingtituted

or made prior to the commencement ef
this Act.

_ (2) Notwithstanding  anything to Ceatel
the contrary contained in the Limitation”%ogs. *
Act, 1963, an appeal from a decree or
order made before the commencement

of this Act, which but for the provisions

of this Act, would have been preferred
before the High Court within ninety days’
from thedate of such decree or order,

shall be preferred to the District Judge,
within the said period.

5. Nothing in +this Act shall be
deemed to affect any appeal instituted
prior to the commencement of this Act.

U. TAHBILDAR,
Secretary to the Govt of Assam,
Legislative Department.

-‘Cauhati-—Printed and published by the Supdt, ijc., Assam Govt. Printing Piess,

(Ex-Gerette) No.]57=—85075—2,000—9-3-1976.

»

b g i L e e







372 THE ASSAM GAZETTE . EXTRAQRDINARY. MAY 12 1993,
| © Assam Act No. VII OF 1993,
(Received the assent of the President on 30.3.93)
- THE BENGAL, AGRA AND ASSAM CIVIL COURTS
- (ASSAM-AMENDMENT) ACT, 1992.

4

further to amend the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil
Courts Act, 1887, n its apphcanon to the State of
Assam T

Preamble " Whereas it is expedient to amend the Bengal,
Agra and Assam Civil Courts Act, 1887, hereinaftet

' called theprincipal Act, inits apphcauon to the State of

Assam, in: the manner héreinafter appearmg,

It is hereby enacted in the Forty-Third Year of the
_chubhe of-India as follows :-

~Short title, " 1.(1) This Act may be called the Bengal, Agra
extent and and Assam Civil Courts (Assam Amendment) Act,
commencement. 1992. .

&

@It shdli cxtend to the whole of the State of Assam.
(3) Tt shall come into force at once.

Amendment 2.(1) I section 19 of the principal Act, in sub-
of section 19 - section (1), for the words "three thousand rupees” the

of the Central words "seven thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
Act 12 of 1887. & : '

(2) In section 19 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2)
for the words "ten thousand rupees" the words
'”tw_entyﬁve thousand-rupees" shali be substituted.

Amendment 3. In section 21 of the principal Act, in sub-
of section section (1), in clause (a), for the words . twenty
21 of the thousand rupees”, the words™ "fifty thousand rupees”

Central Act shall be subst[tuted
12 of 1887. :

e

%



W%

Savings
.
-
Guwadhati
[
¢

.

Retrospective 2
(1) of section 21 of the principal Act, as amended by

operation:

THE ASSAM GAZETTE. . EXTRAORDINARY. MAY 12 . 1993. 373

4. (1) The provision of clause (a) of sub-s ectiof’

section 3 of this Act, shall apply irrespective of the fact

that suits, proceedings, decrees or orders out of which
the appeals referred to therein arise, were instituted or
made prior-to the commencement of this Act.

(2)~Notwithstanding anything to the contrary
contained in the Limiitation Act, 1963, an appeal from 2
decree or order made before the commencement of this
Act, which but for the provisions of this Act, would
have been preferred before the High-Court within ninety
days from the date of such decree or order shall be

‘preferred to the District Judge, within the said period.

5.Nothing in this Act shall be deemed to affect
any appeal instituted priorto the Commencement of this
Act. ;

K. LASKAR,
Secretary to the Government of Assam,.
Legislative Department.

Printed and published by the Dy:Director (), Directorate of Ptg. an
Sty. Assam GCuwahati-21 (Ex. GaZette) No. 113-865-400-12-5-93.

AL

F R

e B

V72




-

(G
k. WO
— 0. 6. 4%

Registered No. A-12

e

e ~
1,. R’s Libravy
L.—_,_____.__-—F-_)
AfEE TEF - N

OHY Qe AG
THE ASSAM GAZETTE ~
i

EXTRAORDINARY s

oe TETN T ATTTS
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

=110 fee , oI, 5 o%, 1997, 15 ==, 1919 1)
No. 119 Dispur, Monday, Sth May, 1997, 15th Vaisakha, 1919 (S.E.)

GOVERNMENT OF ASSAM
ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR
LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT : LEGISLATIVE BRANCH

NOTIFICATION
The 5th May, 1997

No. LGL.42/96/33 .- The following Act of the Assam Legislative
ssembly which received the assent of the Prisident/Governor is hereby

Ly

" published for general information.

—————




’ 386 THE ASSAM GAZETIE. EXTRAORDINARY. MAY 5. 1997

I . \‘é ) *_;‘ -

Preamble.

Short title,

extent and

commence-

ment.

Substitution
ofwords
" Assistant
District
Judge" and
“munsif’ in
Central Act
TR | 1887.

Repeal and
saving.

ASSAM ACT NO. XV OF 1997
(Received the Assent of the President on 18th April, 1997)

THE BENGAL, AGRA AND ASSAM CIVIL COURTS
(ASSAM AMENDMENT) ACT, 1996
AN

ACT

Further to amend the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil
Courts Actr, 1887, in its application 10 the State of
Assam.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Bengal, central
Agra and Assam Civil Courts Act, 1887, hereinafter AcXI
referred to as the principal Act, in its application 0 the of 1887
State of Assam, in the manner hereinafter appearing ;

It is hereby enacted in the Forty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India as follows :-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Bengal, Agra and
Assam Civil Courts (Assam Amendment) Act,
1996.

(2) It shall have the like extent as the principal Act.
(3) Tt shall come into force at once.

2. In the pr'mcipal Act, for the words, "Assistant District
Judge" and "Munsiff", wherever they occur, the words
and brackets, "Civil J udge (Senior Division)" and "Civil
Judge (Junior Division)" respectively shall be
substituted.

3. (1) The Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil Courts (Assam
Amendment) Ordinance, 1996 is hereby repealed.

2 Notwithstanding such repeal anything done or any
action taken under the Ordinance sO repealed shall be
deemed to have been done or taken under the
corresponding provisions of this Act.

M. K. DEKA,
Secretary to the Govt. of Assam,
{_egislative Department.

GUOWAHNATL - Printed and published by the Dy. Director (P&S), Sirectorate of Pig. and

. - an ol LR

Sty. Assam, Guwahati-21 (Ex-Gazetie) No. 237-750-605-5-3-97.

SR o e




-

RN R i

ety RS

r: RS Libravs " 2‘(/{ g | ; q >
I 1965
19¢7

= ARGE TTE - aur/>

1979

Registered No. - 768/97

t

1993
5 1994
; ()
@ A NG 2005
m | i {/.'! , 44}
THE ASSAM GAZETTE
R RINER
EXTRAORDINARY

orey TELI 7 LTS
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

R 566 R, grfeam, 13 wraws, 1997, 22 =S, 1919 &%)
Ne. 566 Dispur; Thursday, 13th November, 1997, 22ndKartika, 1919 (S.E)

" GOVERNMENT OF. ASSAM.. -
" ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR

LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT : LEGISLATIVE BRANCH

NOTIFICATION

Ny

The 7th November, 1997

No. LGL. 138/91/46 : The following Act of the Assam Legislative

Assembly which received the assent of the President/Governor is hereby
- published for general information.

[ &




96y 7 ¢y e
D 7 9
A ~, q 3

ASSAM ACT NO. XX1IV OF 1997

( Received the Assent of the President on 20th October, 1997 )

THE BENGAL, AGRA AND ASSAM CIVIL COURTS
(SECOND ASSAM AMENDMENT ) ACT, 1996

AN
ACT

further to amend the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil Courts
Act, 1887, in its application to the State of Assam.

Preamble. Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Bengal, Agra  Central
-and Assam Civil Courts Act, 1887, hereinafter referred to as the Aa-XT
principal Act, in its application-to the State of Assam, in the 1887
manner hereinafler appearing ;
It is hereby enacted in the Forty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India as follows :-
Short title, 1. (1) This Act may be called the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil
extent and Courts (Second Assam Amendment) Act, 1996,
Cormmencement.
(2) It shall extend to the whole of Assam.
(3) It shall come into force at once.
Insertion of new 2. In the principal Act, after section 21, the following shall be
section 21A inserted as section 21A, namely :-
"Power to 21A. An appeal from a decree or order of an Assistant District
Transferpending  Judge, where the value of the original suit in which or any
appeals to proceeding arising out of which decree or order was made exceeds
District Judge.  twenty thousand rupees but does not exceed fif ty thousand rupees
instituted in the High Court before the date of commencement of
the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil Courts (Assam Amendment)
Act, 1992 and pending in the High Court immediately before the
said date, shall stand transferred to District Judge having
Jurisdiction who shall decide the appeal according io law or assign -
it 1o any Additional District Judge.
Amendmentof  3- 10 the the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil Courts (Assam
section Sof the  Mendment) Act, 1992, in section 5, for the words, "prior to the
Bengal, Agraand COMmencement of this Act, "the words”, "save and except the
Assam Civil appeals instituted to High Court against the decree or order of an
Counts (Assam  Assistant District Judge under clause (b) of sub section (1) of
Amendment) section 21," shall be substituted.
Act, 1992,
M. K. DEKA,
Secrctary to the Govt. of Assam,
Legistative Department.
GUWAHATI - Printed and Published by the Dy. Director (P), Directorate of Ptg, and Sty.,

Assam, Guwahati-21 (Ex. Gazette) No. 1129-750-600-13-11-97.

|7




S N EETY

- .__uh—-._..___,._ﬁ__;;__';_:-IRegistered No. - 768/97

=24
e
* THE ASSAM GAZETTE
. EXTRAORDINARY
b | o
NG IEGR 79T o G
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
W17 o, wormam, g9 RIS, 2005, 28 °%. 1926 (31%)
No.17 Dispur, Tuesday, 18th January, 2005, 28t Pausa, 1926 (S.E.)’
—— T T Sham
GOVERNMENT OF ASSAM
ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR P
- ' LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT 12t LEGISLATIVE BRANCH

NOTIFICATION

S AITICARION
The 18th Jan uary, 2005

No. LGL.138/91/64.- The foll
Assembly which recelved tl
general information.

owing Act of the Assam Legislative
1€ assent of the Governor ig hereby published for




(Received the assent of the Governor on |

Preamble

F
THE BENGAL, AGRA AND ASSAM CIVIL COURT%!;’
(ASSAM AMENDMENT) ACT, 2004. ‘%
AN )
s A
ACT N
further to amend the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil -
Courts Act, 1887, inits application to the State of Assam.
Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Central
Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil Courts Act, 1887, Af“ié‘g‘_;
0 .

Short title,
extent and
commence-
ment.

Substitution
of words and -
brackets
«Civil Judge
{Senior
Division)”
and “Civil
Judge
(Junior
Division)” in
Central Act
X11 of 1887.

ASSAM ACT NO. [V OF 2005

hereinafter Act, in its application to the State of Assam,
in the manner hereinafter appearing ;

It is hereby enacted in the Fifty-fifth Year of the
Republic of India as follows - '

1. (1) This Act may be called the Bengal, Agra and Assam
Civil Courts (Assam Amendment) Act, 2004.

(2) 1t shall have the like extent as the principal Act.

(3) Tt shall come into force at once.

2. In the principal Act, for the words and brackets “Civil
Judge (Senior Division” and “Cjvil Judge (Junior
Division)”, wherever they occur, the words “Civil
Judge” and “Munsiff” respectively shall be substituted.

M. K. DEKA,

48 THEASSAM GAZETTE. EXTRAORDINARY. JAN. 18, 2005 sl

e

e

3th January, 2005) ‘ *

Commissioner & Secy. to the Govt. of Assam,

Legislative Department, Dispur.

GUWAHATI- Printed & Published by the Dy. Director (P

Assam, Guwahati-21, (Ex-Gazette) No. 13-500-600-18-1-2003.

sty. ASSAILL, U a7 .

&S), Directorate of Pig. & Sty.,

P et T

5 a ..gf“"

L]

¥




HETST AT - LWy Y LAreagr~ ... 70"
' L= }
# B

. "oy Ebradey

THE ASSAM GAZETTE
ST
EXTRAORDINARY
41 ST FTF AFIFS
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

72 400 Feioq, w@ae, 23 feree, 2005, 2 93, 1927 (719)
No. 409 Dispur, Friday, 23rd December, 2005, 2nd Pausha, 1927 (S.E.)

GOVERNMENT OF ASSAM
ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR
LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT :: LEGISLATIVE BRANCH

NOTIFICATION

The 22nd December, 2005

No.LGL. 138/91/78. :-- The following Act of the Assam Legislative Assembly which received the
assent of the Governor is hereby published for general information.

ASSAM ACT NO. XLIV OF 2005
(Received the assent of Governor on 19th December. 2005)

THE BENGAL, AGRA AND ASSAM CIVIL COURTS
(ASSAM AMENDMENT) ACT, 2005
AN
ACT
Further to amend the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil Courts Act, 1887, in its application
to the State of Assam.

Preamble. Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Bengal, Agra and Central

Assam Civil Courts Act, 1887, hereinafter referred to as the Principal Aﬁs’;‘;
i .

Act, in its application to the State of Assam, in the manner hereinafter
appearing ;

It is hereby enacted in the Fifty-sixth Year of the Republic of India
as follows :-

Short title, 1. (1) This Act may be called the Bengal, Agra and Assam Civil Courls
extent, and (Assam Amendment) Act. 2005.
commencement.

(2) It shall extend to the whole of Assam.
(3) It shall come into force at once.

’2_0




3252 THE ASSAM GAZETTE, BXTRAORDINARY, DECEMBER 23, 2005.

Adendment 2. In the Principal Act, in Section 19-
of Section 19...- (i) in sub-section (1), for the -words "seven thousand rupees”. the
words "fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "twenty five thousand rupees”
the words "two lakhs rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment 3. Inthe Principal Act, in Section 21, in sub-section (1), in clause (a),
of Section 21. for the words "fifty thousand rupees” the words" five lakh rupees”
shall be substituted.

M. K. DEKA,
Commissioner and Secretary 10 the Govt. of Assam,
Legislative Department, Dispur.

GUWAHATI- Printed and published by the Dy Director (P. & S.) Directorate of Ptg. and Sty., Assam, Guwahati-21.
(Ex. Gazefte) No. 81 7-500+600-23-12-2005.

B . o Kt i e




1\ Noome -, % Ma/ﬁL} ﬁ%;w\ ﬁ’nck m
eodll Rownlln A, 1227
R CRd FL 4 ige7)

- s Srmankmind t o

r_r:{;p___
925 (6)
PO - - 1965 ( 9)
| 19 67 (12)
| | 1974 (11)
Y | 979 (1)
o | 1992 (7)
199 7 (15) (24)

005 @ L 44




